1674

SERVINGS

Bun, - Frozen. Indivi Thaw
and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum
of 2.0 oz. Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition
Program.

Approximate pack: 80-2.5 oz. servings per case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

EVALUATED.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING

SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT

AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND

Super Bakery 6060

500,000

Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Frozen By the Serving

Bake Crafters

Net 14

Bake Crafters

2003

60/3 0z

60

$0.57

8,333

$34.19

$284,900.00

3 weeks

1674

SERVINGS

Bun, - Frozen. Indivi Thaw
and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum
of 2.0 oz. Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition
Program.

Approximate pack: 80-2.5 oz. servings per case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Super Bakery 6060

500,000

Sky Blue Bakery

Net 21

Sky Blue Bakery

WWB5160

60/2.60z

60

$0.51

8,333,333

$30.41

$255.0000

Direct delivered 12 pallet
minimum -

84 cases/pallet, full
pallets required.
Combined with any SBB
products. Awarded
WMBLU248 Bid BID #
05302024MES

3 weeks

1674

2350

2351

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

Bun, - Frozen. Indivi Thaw
and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum
of 2.0 oz. Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition
Program.

Approximate pack: 80-2.5 oz. servings per case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

‘Smoothie, Mango-Pineapple, Frozen - Mango-
Pineapple flavored yogurt based smoothie. Meets 1
meat/meat alternate and 1/2 cup fruit for child nutrition
program. Packed in a carton or bottle. Serving size
approximately 7-8 oz.

Approximate Pack: 50 per case

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

y-B: , Frozen - Y-
Banana flavored yogurt based smoothie. Meets 1
meat/meat alternate and 1/2 cup fruit for child nutrition
program. Packed in a carton or bottle. Serving size
approximately 7-8 oz.

Approximate Pack: 50 per case

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Super Bakery 6060

Bar Fresh TGMPY50

Bar Fresh TGSBY50

500,000

50,000

50,000

Super Bakery

sYsco
MEMPHIS, LLC

sYsco
MEMPHIS, LLC

Net 30

NET 14 DAYS

NET 14 DAYS

GoodyBun

BARFRESH

BARFRESH

6060

TGMPY50
(7232882)

TGSBY50 (7232959)

1of17

2.750z.

50/7.60Z

50/7.60Z

80

50

50

$0.42

$0.94

$0.94

6,250

1,000

1,000

$33.76

$47.22

$47.22

$211,000.00

$47,220.00

$47,220.00

200 cs. Mixed product
minimum for delivery

NEW ITEM SET UP

NEW ITEM SET UP

4 weeks

6 WEEKS

6 WEEKS

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD




Fries, Spicy - Crisp and spicy 3/8" straigh cut fries ready
to be baked, frozen, containing zero grams of trans fat.
Each serving must meet 1/2 cup of vegetable.
Approximately Packed: 6-4.5 Ibs. per case.

2364 SERVINGS

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Ham, Buffet Pre-Sliced - Fully cooked boneless, pre-
sliced, buffet style ham steak. Each serving slice must
credit as 2 oz. meat/meat alternates for the Child
Nutrition Program.

3021 SERVINGS
Ship Lot: 300 Cases

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT
AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND
EVALUATED.

Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Frozen By the Serving

Cavendish 5621035101-2

250,000 NO BID

No Approved Brands

sYsco

250,000 MEMPHIS, LLC

NO BID

NET 14 DAYS

NO BID NO BID

HORMEL 33279 (2279057)

NO BID

413 #

96

#DIV/0!

2,604

$0.00

$54.24

#DIV/0!

$141,250.00

4 WEEKS

NO BID

NO SAMPLE
SENT
NO AWARD

20f17



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)

Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid 11

Frozen By the Pound

Estimated Estimated Lead Time From
Stock . . Approved Brand Estimated Number of . . . Manufacturer's Pack Cost Per N Required Number Cost Per Extended Total . AWARDS
Number Rt DescHption (Manufacture Product Code) Units (2024-2025) Blccey Blccerietns BlcceyBiand Product Code Size Pou::ss:er Pound Serv(l:r:: ke of Cases Needed Case Cost Comments RiceginiWeeks
Column1 | Column2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18 Column 19
Items listed are Pre-
PACK SIZES FOR THE | /\Pproved Brands,
MSCS will accept an
Bid Submissions That Deviate RoLOWING approved equal (1)
From What Is Being Requested SAEAE NN (AU azli'on as ilt:I meets
In The S| ecificaliongs Bec:ow Wwill RN AR, (L the bidgs ecification ASDSUIREOTS
D — PACK SIZES WILL BE P ARE IN CASES.
Be Considered A Non and (2) tested and
Acceptable Vendor Response. JIHORODGHEY] approved through
P ponse. CONSIDERED AND I'\)IIPSCS'S S Ii
EVALUATED. SEL
Submission
Process.
Stir Fry Vegetable Blend - Simplot 10071179607762
Frozen, should contain broccoli
florets, kernel corn, diced red
peppers, shelled edamame and
matchstick carrots. 2% 10 net 15 simplot Simple
1493 | POUND _ 300,000 JR.Simplot | daysfrom | o 4o kvoto | 10071179607762 |  6/2.5# 1625 | $1.8350769 84.5 3,550 $2082 | $105,869.82 2 Weeks (14 AWARD
Approximate Packed 6/2.5 Ib. Company invoice or 30 Vegetable Blend Days)
pkgs./case. days net
Ship Lot: 300 Cases
Mixed Vegetable Blend, Country {No Approved Brands
Frozen, IQF, corn, carrots, green
beans, peas, and lima beans.
Packed to Grade A standard. AWARD
Serving size must equal 1/2 cup
vegetable equivalent for the Child SUNLEAF- SAMPLE
3024 | POUND [nutrition program. Pack 12/2.5 Ib 200,000 CHUCHFIELD |\ pr 5, NATIONAL 112259 30 $2.15 151 1,325 $64.50 | $85,430.46 4 WEEKS
bags. Approximately 160 servings TRADING FROZEN SENT
per case. If packed differently FOODS SAMPLE
lease indicate.
P PASSED

Ship Lot: 400 Cases




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Dry By the Serving

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT
AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND
EVALUATED.

1089

SERVINGS

Chocolate Chip Cookies - IW, Mini Chocolate Chip  |Bakecrafters 527
Cookies. Single mini Cl Chip 66154
Cookies to meet 1 oz. grain equivalent for the Child
Nutrition Program. Must provide CN or crediting
statement and Smart Snack guidelines. Packed 100
per case. If packed diferently, please indicate.

300,000 NO BID

Ship Lot: 200

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

NO BID

1826

1828

1853

SERVING

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

Beverage, Sport Drink - Fruit Punch flavored.- Non |Gatorade G2 - 10052000122029
carbonated, caffeine free, sugar free to contain no more
than 110 mg Na per 12 oz. Packed in non breakable
container.

Approximate Pack:24/120Z 50,000 SYSCO MEMPHIS,

LLc

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Sports Drink, Glacier Freeze - Non- carbonated, 12 Glacier Freeze- 10052000120063
oz. reduced sugar beverage with no more than 110 mg
sodium per serving. packged in a non breakble
resealable bottle. Pack size 24/12 oz. bottles/case.

50,000 SYSCO MEMPHIS,

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Pretzels, Mini WG - Mini pretzel sticks, bagged or Bake Crafters- 5712
packed by the serving so that each serving is equal to
10z eq of grain per Child Nutrition Program guidelines.
Crediting statement required. Trans fat free.

Approximate Pack: 100/1.2 oz 200,000 NO BID

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

NET 14 DAYS

NET 14 DAYS

NO BID

GATORADE

GATORADE

NO BID

12202 (8567093)

12006 (7158811)

NO BID

24/120Z

241202

NO BID

24

24

NO BID

$0.69

$0.69

$16.63

$16.63

2,083.33

2,083.33

#VALUE!

$34,645.83

$34,645.83

#VALUE!

NEW ITEM - SET
UP THROUGH
FRITO LAY
CURRENTLY
REMOTE

Mini Snack Crackers, WG - Made with whole wheat JNS Foods/Back to Basics - 37401 AWARD
flour. Each serving provides a minimum of 2 oz grain Samples sent for
equivalent for the child nutrition program. Individually aPZP'U"al: of ﬁee
ackaged. Approximate pack: 100/case i ees brand.
1762 SERvINGs  |Packaged Aep P 400,000 N“"g’f‘:"j:“d Net 30 Days Zee Zees 624101 150/ 1.5 0z 150 $0.3547 $53.20 2,666.67 $141,866.67 | Please order in 4 weeks Sls\l::#E
Ship Lot: 400 Cases even pallet
quantities of 56 SAMPLE
case increments. PASSED
Mini Snack Crackers, WG - Made with whole wheat JNS Foods/Back to Basics - 37401
flour. Each serving provides a minimum of 2 oz grain
equivalent for the child nutrition program. Individually Origi
. . iginal Wheat
1762 SERVINGS |Packaged. Approximate pack: 100/case 400,000 J&d s'(';i'; Foods | \ot30days | Crunch & Crave 2049192 100/1.60z 400,000 034ea $34.00 4,000.00 $136,000.00 |Flavor. Additional| 2 weeks . Sslliw: LE
: flavors available.

3 WEEKS

4 WEEKS

AWARD

AWARD

NO BID

40f17



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Dry By the Serving

1872

1876

1916

2354

2355

2356

2357

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

SERVINGS

Almond Milk, Vanilla Flavored- Shelf stable 8 oz,
vanilla flavored. Free of dairy, soy, lactose,
gluten,casein, egg, and MSG. 8 oz. single serve
containers. Case pack 18 servings, indicate if packed
differently.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Milk, Soy, Chocolate Flavored 8 oz- Shelf stable soy
based milk. To contain all nutrients to qualify as
reimbursable through the USDA Child Nutrition program
as fluid milk.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Cheese Sauce Heat and Serve Bulk Pouch — Heat in
Pouch. Item should be shelf stable. Each serving
should meet a minimum equivalent of 10z M/MA per
the CN program. CN label or crediting statement
required. Approx. pack 6/ 5lb pouches per case.
Approximately 212 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tea, Reduced Sugar, Sweet - Unflavored, 12 oz.
reduced sugar sweet tea. Packed in non breakable
container. Must meet smart snack guidelines for the
child nutrition program. Please indicate pack size.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Water Flavored, Lemonade - Lemonade flavored
water with zero sugar, 16.9 oz. Packed in non
breakable container. Must meet smart snack guidelines
for the child nutrition program. Please indicate pack
size.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Beverage, Sparkling Juice, Fruit Punch -
Carbonated, caffiene free, no added sweetners to
contain no more than 110 miligrams of sodium per 12
oz. Packed in non iner. Approxi

24 8.4 oz cans. Please indicate if packed differently.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Fruit Snack, Assorted Fruit - Fruit flavored snacks
made from 100% fruit juice. Mixed fruit flavored. Must
meet smart snack guidelines for the child nutrition
program.

Approximate Pack: 144 per case. Please indicate pack
size.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Silk 136461

Silk 0177321

Kikkoman 06185

Land O Lakes 39945
Lucky Leaf FFCSL0808LKLO1
Bay Valley Foods 79871061170

No Approved Brands

Blue Triton 68274911606

No Approved Brands

Welch's 14498

80,000

100,000

800,000

25,000

25,000

25,000

75,000

NO BID

SYSCO MEMPHIS,
LLc

NET 14 DAYS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

SYSCO MEMPHIS,
LLC

NO BID

NET 14 DAYS

LoL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NET 14 DAYS

NO BID

KIKKOMAN

39945 (7196024)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

GM-MOTTS

NO BID

6185-- (7002197)

6/106 OZ

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

479540 (4407427)

NO BID

24/80Z

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

144/1.60Z

NO BID

$1.61

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$0.89

$1.61

$0.43

$21.39

77.04

$61.98

#VALUE!

4,166.67

$16,666.67

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

520.83

#VALUE!

$89,125.00

$1,284,000.26

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

$32,281.25

3 weeks

3 WEEKS

NO BID

AWARD

AWARD

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

50f17




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)

Division of Nutrition Services

2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid II

Dry By the Serving

Stock Approved Brand Estimated Number of Bidder Bidder Ma s Cost Cost Required Extended LEAD TIME
Number Unit Description (Manufaczure Product Code) Servings Bidder Terms Brand Product Code Pack Size |Estimated Servings Per Per Number of Total Comments FROM ORDER AWARDS
(2024-2025) Serving Case Cases Cost (IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18
Fruit Snack, Assorted Fruit - Fruit flavored snacks Welch's 14498
made from 100% fruit juice. Mixed fruit flavored. Must
meet smart snack guidelines for the child nutrition AWARD
program. ASSORTED AND
CHURHFIELD GENERAL 47954000 AND SAMPLE
2357 SERVINGS Approximate Pack: 144 per case. Please indicate pack 75,000 TRADING NET 30 MILLS/IMOTTS 47953000 144/1.6 0Z 144 $0.41 $59.25 520.83 $30,859.38 MléEEV%iFaSRY 3 WEEKS SENT
size.
SAMPLE
PASSED
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Chips, Corn & Potato Hot Stix - Whole Grain hot No Approved Brands
flavored corn and potato chip. Stick-shaped chip. Must
be smart snack compliant. Must meet 1 oz. grain
equivalent for the child nutrition program. Total fat must
not exceed 35% of calories. Sat fat must not exceed
10% of total calories and no mor than 230 mg. of
2359 SERVINGS sodium. Minimun shelf life: 30 days from delivery date. 100,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID
Approximate pack: 104/case. Please indicate if packed
differently.
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Toaster Pastry, Whole Grain Brown Sugar- No Approved Brands
Individually Wrapped, Frosted, Fully Cooked, Minimum
portion 2.25 oz. Must be less than 35% of calories from
fat, 10% sat. fat and 35% sugar by weight, At least 4 SAMPLE
grams of fiber/serving. Must provide at least 2 oz grain ENT
2363 SERVINGS equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program. Packed: 72 288,000 SYSCOLTEMPHIS' NET 14 DAYS KELLANOVA 55125-(0445090) 72/3.30Z 72 $0.51 $36.44 4,000.00 $145,760.00 DROP SHIP 2 WEEKS SiMPLE
servings/case.
PASSED
Ship Lot: 500 Cases
Toaster Pastry, Whole Grain Brown Sugar- No Approved Brands
Individually Wrapped, Frosted, Fully Cooked, Minimum
portion 2.25 oz. Must be less than 35% of calories from AWARD
fat, 10% sat. fat and 35% sugar by weight, At least 4
grams of fiber/serving. Must provide at least 2 oz grain KELLANOVA- 0.5% 15 NET SAMPLE
2363 SERVINGS equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program. Packed: 72 288,000 KEL(I:_g'ﬁSASNAYLES 16 DAYS KELLOGG 38000-55125 72/3.30z 72 $0.46 $32.80 4,000.00 $131,200.00 2 WEEKS SENT
servings/case.
SAMPLE
Ship Lot: 500 Cases PASSED
Yogurt, Strawberry - shelf stable lowfat strawberry Backpack Yogurt - SBYLF101
flavored yogurt. Packed 48 cups per case. Please Samples sent to SAMPLE
indicate if packed differently. " be apprived ENT
2380 CASE 400 Na"g":' Food | Net 30 Days Zee Zees 623378 48140z 48 $0.61 $29.10 8.33 $242.50 brand. Please 4 weeks S
roup order in even SAMPLE
Ship Lot: 200 Cases pallet quantities. FAILED
Yogurt, Vanilla - shelf stable lowfat vanilla flavored Backpack Yogurt - VYLF101
yogurt. Packed 48 cups per case. Please indicate if Samples sent to SAMPLE
packed differently. be apprived
National Food SENT
2381 CASE 400 Net 30 Days Zee Zees 623376 48/ 4 oz 48 $0.61 $29.10 8.33 $242.50 brand. Please 4 weeks
Group order in even SAMPLE
Ship Lot: 200 Cases pallet quantities. FAILED

60f17




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il
Dry By the Case

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Pickles, Dill Hamburger, Sliced -|Bay Valley 127/12822891393
Each jar is securely sealed to Cajun Chef

prevent leakage and contains a  [Heinz 5218904

resealable lid for each jar. Bay Valley 12746771170
Contains approx. 1125 smooth
cut slices. packed to USDA
Grade A.

Approximate Pack: 6-5.75 pound
plastic pickle jars/case

1M1 CASE 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,000 $0.00 NO BID

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Gochujang Sauce- Gochujang |Kogi KG3263HG
flavored. No MSG, preservatives, |Ventura 22778SCR
artificial flavors, or high fructose
corn syrup. Bright and appetizing
color with a sweet & savory taste.
ﬁzzmmate pack size 6/ 5ib 800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 800 $0.00

1206 CASE NO BID

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Asian Food Solutions 93006
CHEF'S Corner Foods

Asian Inspired Sauce- Sweet
and Sour flavored. No MSG,
preservatives, artificial flavors, or |OFC-2177
high fructose corn syrup. Wheat |JTM 73460
Free. Bright and appetizing color

SHIP LOT: 300 Cases

with a sweet & savory taste. sysco NET 14
1209 CASE | Approximate pack size 6/ jugs 1,000 MEMPHIS, LLC | DAYS JTM 73460 ( 1659071) 6/5# 480 1,000 $58,650.00 | NEW ITEM SET UP 5 WEEKS
per case. If packed differently,
please indicate pack size.
SHIP LOT: 300 Cases
Asian Inspired Sauce- Sweet Asian Food Solutions 93006
and Sour flavored. No MSG, CHEF'S Corner Foods
preservatives, artificial flavors, or |OFC-2177
high fructose corn syrup. Wheat |JTM 73460 4200 Lbs.
Free. Bright e:;d appetizing color 6 bags can be mixed
with a sweet & savory taste.
1209 CASE  [aon e Cmate pack sive 6/ Jugs 1,000 ™ Net 30 J™ 73460 30.00# 480 $0.11 $52.79 1,000 ss2,790.00 | Product f;;':::‘ é;"’:z;‘:) AWARD
per case. 'If packed differently. case JTM Spec'd 73460,
please indicate pack size. Frozen.




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il

Dry By the Case
Estimated Number of . . . . . Cost Required Extended LEAD TIME
N?At::ltl:)tr Unit Description (Manulf\apc'::::e:rz;::f(:o de) Cases Bidder ?:::’:; BBI;:j lg::::.-::;ls Pack Size Estlm:::‘::::;vmgs (;t;sr:il;er Per Number of Total Comments FROM ORDER AWARDS
(2024-2025) 9 Case Cases Cost (IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18 Column 19
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS
Bid Submissions That Deviate | PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approved
From What Is Being Requested SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT equal (1) as long as it ALL SHIP LOTS
In The Specifications Below CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK meets the bid ARE IN CASES.
Will Be Considered A Non SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY specification and (2) .
A Vendor R CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED. tested and approved
through MSCS's Sample
Submission Process.
Chili Lime Seasoning - Reduced | Tajin 28805
Sodium - with chili peppers, lime,
and sea salt. Individual packets,
1 gram. Approximately 1000 per
case. Serving size = 1 packet.
1224 CASE 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 400 $0.00 NO BID
Ship Lot: 200 Cases
Chamoy Hot Sauce - Fruity - Tajin 4810212
Must contain chili peppers, lime,
sea salt, and fruit flavor. Must be
gluten free and no artificial colors
or flavors. Individual packets,
.270z. Approximately 500 per
1225 CASE case. Serving size = 1 packet. 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 400 $0.00 NO BID
Ship Lot: 200 Cases
Oil, Vegetable, Blend - GFS/Cargill 61488
Vegetable oil for frying, baking Harvest Value 291524
and salads. Should be trans fat | Chef's Pride 54107
free (0 grams trans fat), no BHT |Wesson 2700061234
Approximate Pack: 6/1
1276 CASE |gallon/case. 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 250 $0.00 NO BID
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Cajun Seasoning - Seasoning to [McCormick 974235
contain garlic, cayenne pepper, |Assagio Classico 710558
onion, black pepper, red and Badia 00616
green bell pepper, herbs and
spices. Case to contain 6/16 - 21 sysco NET 14
oz. plastic resealable containers.
1373 CASE P 300 MEMPHIS, LLC DAYS MCCORMICK | 974235 (5228424) 6/180Z 638 $0.14 $89.52 300 $26,856.00 3 WEEKS
Ship Lot: 100 Cases




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il

Dry By the Case
Estimated Number of . . . . . Cost Required Extended LEAD TIME
N?At::ltl:)tr Unit Description (Manulf\apc'::::e:rz;::f(:o de) Cases Bidder ?:::’:; BBI;:j lg::::.-::;ls Pack Size Estlm:::‘::::;vmgs (;t;sr:il;er Per Number of Total Comments FROM ORDER AWARDS
(2024-2025) 9 Case Cases Cost (IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18 Column 19
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS
Bid Submissions That Deviate | PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approved
From What Is Being Requested SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT equal (1) as long as it ALL SHIP LOTS
In The Specifications Below CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK meets the bid ARE IN CASES.
Will Be Considered A Non SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY specification and (2) .
A Vendor R CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED. tested and approved
through MSCS's Sample
Submission Process.
Cajun Seasoning - Seasoning to [McCormick 974235
contain garlic, cayenne pepper, |Assagio Classico 710558
onion, black pepper, red and Badia 00616
green bell pepper, herbs and o .
spices. Case to contain 6/16 - 21 Pricing is delivered
1373 CASE |0z plastic resealable containers. 300 Badia Net30 Badia 00616 61230z 8.625 Lbs $3.62 $31.24 300 $9,372.00 br:isrﬁfnsr’;api;ogg:? 15 BUSINESS DAYS AWARD
not per item
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Vinegar - 1 gallon plastic jugs, Sysco Memphis LLC (911123)
disilled, white, 4-5% acetic acid. |GFS/Woeber 7468000211
Packer 4713475
Kaiser # 08371
Gordon Mizkan America's 107247 HURCHFIELD
1377 CASE Ship Lot: 100 Cases Garden Club #608054100 800 ¢ ?R:DING NET 30 WOEBER 7468000211 4/1 GAL 1024 $0.04 43.5 800 $34,800.00 MIN ORDER 96 3 WEEKS
Rich In All 526- 18999
Vinegar - 1 gallon plastic jugs, Sysco Memphis LLC (911123)
disilled, white, 4-5% acetic acid. |GFS/Woeber 7468000211
Packer 4713475
Kaiser # 08371
Gordon Mizkan America's 107247 HURCHFIELD
1377 CASE Ship Lot: 100 Cases Garden Club #608054100 800 c ?R:DING NET 30 RICH IN ALL 526-78999 4/1 GAL 1024 $0.03 $36.77 800 $29,416.00 MIN ORDER 432 3 WEEKS AWARD
Rich In All 526- 78999
Honey, Ind Pkg - 5-9g individual |Ventura Foods 47245HLN
packet of US Grade A pure
honey. Golden in color. Sweet
flavor. Approximate pack size NO AWARD
1389 CASE  [200 per case. 400 CH%I::;:I(E;LD NET 30 | ICIFOODS ICIHS50 Cg’ﬁ’,\?T 50 $0.93 $46.44 400 $18,576.00 3 WEKS DOES NOT MEET

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

SPEC




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il

Dry By the Case

Stock
Number

Unit

Description

Approved Brand
(Manufacture Product Code)

Estimated Number of
Cases
(2024-2025)

Bidder

Bidder
Terms

Bidder
Brand

Manufacturer's

Product Code BacSleg

Estimated Servings
Per Case

Cost Per
Serving

Cost
Per
Case

Required
Number of
Cases

Extended
Total
Cost

Comments

LEAD TIME
FROM ORDER
(IN WEEKS)

AWARDS

Column 1

Column 2

Column 3

Column 4

Column 5

Column 6

Column 7

Column 8

Column 9 Column 10

Column 11

Column 12

Column 13

Column 14

Column 16

Column 17

Column 18

Column 19

Bid Submissions That Deviate
From What Is Being Requested
In The Specifications Below
Will Be Considered A Non

A Vendor R

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING

SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY

CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS
will accept an approved
equal (1) as long as it
meets the bid
specification and (2)
tested and approved
through MSCS's Sample
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS
ARE IN CASES.

1917

CASE

Cheese Sauce Heat and Serve
Can — Made with real yellow
cheddar cheese, smooth and
creamy with consistent flavor,
texture and appearance.
Reduced sosium. CN label or
crediting state required. Approx.
pack 6 cans per case. If packed
differently, please indicated.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

Lucky Leaf FFCSL0808LKL01
Bay Valley Foods 79871061170

952

Robbins Sales
Co, Inc

N30

FFCSL0808LKLO1 6/#10

288

$0.1606

$46.24

952

$44,020.48

42 cases per pallet
to meet height
requirement

NO AWARD

PRODUCT NO
LONGER NEEDED

1917

CASE

Cheese Sauce Heat and Serve
Can — Made with real yellow
cheddar cheese, smooth and
creamy with consistent flavor,
texture and appearance.
Reduced sosium. CN label or
crediting state required. Approx.
pack 6 cans per case. If packed
differently, please indicated.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

Lucky Leaf FFCSL0808LKLO01
Bay Valley Foods 79871061170

952

CHURCHFIELD
TRADING

NET 30

LUCKY LEAF

FFCSL0808LKLO1 6 # 10

288

$0.20

$57.62

952

$54,854.24

min order 336

3 weeks

NO AWARD

PRODUCT NO
LONGER NEEDED

1919

CASE

Ranch Dressing, Light or
Reduced Fat - Prepared, ready
to use in 4/1 gallon jars per case
to include a portion pump.
Contains no MSG. Creamy white
color with a touch of garlic, onion,
spices and black pepper for high
quality ranch dressing. Should
contain no more than 3 grams of
fat per 2 tablespoons of dressing.
If packed differently, please
indicate.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Marzetti 80088

500

sysco
MEMPHIS, LLC

NET 14
DAYS

NATURALLY
FRESH-
MARZETTI

953465D5061

(4772471) 4MGAL

512

$0.09

$46.82

500

$23,410.00

INACTIVE- SET UP

4 WEEKS

AWARD




2303

2304

2319

CASE

CASE

CASE

Base, Beef - Shelf stable, low
sodium beef base. In paste form.
No added MSG. Gluten free.
Less than 140mg sodium per
serving. No preservatives or
artificial flavors. Made from beef
stock to include salt, sugar, and
hydrolized corn protein. For hot
and cold applications.
Approximate pack - 6/1 Ib
containers per case. Please
indicate if packed diferently.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Base, Chicken - Shelf stable, low
sodium chicken base. In paste
form. No added MSG. Gluten
free. Less than 140mg sodium
per serving. No preservatives or
artificial flavors. Made from
chicken stock to include
vegetables and herbs. For hot
and cold applications.
Approximate pack - 4/1 Ib
containers per case. Please
indicate if packed diferently.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Oats, Dry - Bulk, quick cooking
whole grained rolled oats. Must
provide CN label or crediting
statement the child nutrition
program. Approximate pack size:
12 42 oz. canisters. If packed
differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING

No Approved Brands

Chef's Companion 57463
Foothill Farms 575T-T0700

Treehouse W53522T5265

300

300

400

8Ysco
MEMPHIS, LLC

8Ysco
MEMPHIS, LLC

8Ysco
MEMPHIS, LLC

Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il
Dry By the Case

NET 14
DAYS

NET 14
DAYS

NET 14
DAYS

NESTLE USA-

MINOR 33206 (5814421) 6/1#

NESTLE USA-

MINOR 46206 6/1#

TREEHOUSE-
RALSTON

W53522T5265

(5028972) 1214202

360

$0.19

67.96

$67.41

300

300

400

$20,388.00

$18,774.00

$26,964.00

NEW ITEM

3 WEEKS

3 WEEKS

5 WEEKS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT
SAMPLE PASSED

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT
SAMPLE PASSED

SAMPLE SENT
SAMPLE PASSED




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il

Dry By the Case
Estimated Number of . . . . . Cost Required Extended LEAD TIME
N?Jt::)tr Unit Description (Manulf\a'::':L‘::e:rft;::fCo de) Cases Bidder ?:::’:; BBI;t:s g::::i:‘g;z:s Pack Size Estlm:::t::::;vmgs (;t;sr:li:er Per Number of Total Comments FROM ORDER AWARDS
(2024-2025) 9 Case Cases Cost (IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18 Column 19
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS
Bid Submissions That Deviate | PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approved
From What Is Being Requested SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT equal (1) as long as it ALL SHIP LOTS
In The Specifications Below CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK meets the bid ARE IN CASES.
Will Be Considered A Non SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY specification and (2) .
A Vendor R CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED. tested and approved
through MSCS's Sample
Submission Process.
Oats, Dry - Bulk, quick cooking |Treehouse W53522T75265
whole grained rolled oats. Must
provide CN label or crediting Price is based on
statement the child nutrition FTL (20 cases to a AWARD
program. Approximate pack size: Ma:-o-nMeal pallet/ 1,120 cases);
12 42 oz. canisters. If packed Post Consumer (2% 10 NET earty oatmeal can be SAMPLE SENT
2319 CASE | differently, please indicate. 400 Brands, LLC 1 QHZE';';;“Z g 04650 12142 0z. 360 $1.23 $36.96 400 $14784.00 | ombined with other| 2 "ok SAMPLE PASSED
Oats # 04650 P0§t cereal orders
(1 item per pallet-
full pallets only).
Ship Lot: 200 Cases
Sugar, Powdered - White No Approved Brands
powdered sugar. Packed 24-1
pound boxes. Please indicate if
packed differently.
2358 CASE 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 300 $0.00 NO BID
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Sauce, Hot Honey - Sauce with |Ventura Foods 23700SCR
honey, cayenne and habenero
peppers and other spices. Bold
sweet heat flavor. Packed 4 -1/2
2370 CASE gallons per case. 800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 800 $0.00 NO BID
Ship Lot: 300 Cases
Pickles, Dill Pickle Spears - Bay Valley Foods 12914951170
Each jar is securely sealed to
prevent leakage and contains a AWARD
resealable lid for each jar.
Approximately packed in a case
i ; SYsCo NET 14 129145951170- ( SAMPLE SENT
3100 CASE with 100 spears per jar. 4/1 gallon 600 BAY VALLEY 4/1GAL 304 $0.16 $49.21 600 $29,526.00 3 WEEKS
resealable jars per case. MEMPHIS, LLC DAYS 5821960) SAMPLE PASSED
Ship Lot: 300 Case
Oat Milk - Shelf stable oat based|No Approved Brands
milk. To contain all nutrients to
qualify as reimbursable through AWARD
the USDA Child Nutrition program
as fluid milk.32 oz. container. 12/ sSYSCo NET 14 SAMPLE SENT
2386 CASE (3507 per case. 50 MEMPHIS, LLC | DAYS CHOBANI 1017 (7114720) 6/320Z 24 17.5 50 $875.00 3 WEEKS SAMPLE PASSED

Ship Lot: 50 Cases




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il
Dry By the Each

Number of
Estimated Number Cost LEAD TIME
Approved Brands p . Bidders Containers per Required
Stock Number Unit Description (Manufacture Plocged Bidder et kD Manufacture Pack Size Case e E?Ch Cost Per Case Number Exonded Comments GROM AWARDS
Product Code) (Each) Terms Brand Product Code Container of Cases Total Cost ORDER
(2024-2025) (IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5§ Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 | Column 15[ Column 16 | Column 17 Column 18
Items listed are Pre-
PACK SIZES FOR | Approved Brands,
Bid Submissions That THE FOLLOWING |MSCS will accept an
Deviate From What Is Being| SPECIFICATIONS | approved equal (1)
R.eque.sted In The . REFLECT CURRENT| as ang as |! megts ALL SHIP LOTS
Specifications Below Will AWARDS. ALL |[the bid specification ARE IN CASES
Be Considered A Non PACK SIZES WILL | and (2) tested and :
Acceptable Vendor BE THOROUGHLY | approved through
Response. CONSIDERED AND MSCS's Sample
EVALUATED. Submission
Process.
Seasoning, Dill - Made with |No Approved
a blend of dried spices Brands
flavored with dill, onion, and
parsley. Fresh flavor with a
tinge of sweet-like rye notes.
5056 EACH Approximate pack size: 6/1 Ib 210 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID
containers per case. Please
indicate if packed differently
Ship Lot: 200 Cases
Spice, Cumin, Ground - Badia 00516
Ground cumin with rich aroma | Assagio Classico
and flavor. 25718 AWARD
Approximate Pack size
between 12 116 oz sYSCO NET 14 |MCCORMICK-SYS SAMPLE
1342 EACH containers.Please indicate if 300 : 974065 -- (5239553) 6/140Z 6 4.921 $29.53 300 $8,859.00 3 WEEKS
packed differently. MEMPHIS, LLC DAYS CLs SENT
SAMPLE
PASSED
Ship Lot: 100 Cases
Spice, Cumin, Ground - Badia 00516
Ground cumin with rich aroma | Assagio Classico
and flavor. 25718 Pricing is
Approximate Pack size delivered
between 12 -16 oz. based on a 15 BUSINESS
1342 EACH containers.Please indicate if 300 Badia Net 30 Badia 00516 6/160z 6 5.35 $32.10 300 $9,630.00 | 2,000LB 15 BUSINESS DAYS
packed differently. minimum per DAYS
order not per
item
Ship Lot: 100 Cases




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Food Bid Il

Dry By the Each
Seasoning, Powered Ginger |No Approved
- Made with 100% pure Brands
ginger root. Finest ginger root Pri;ing is AWARD
with authenic flavor. delivered
Approximate pack size: 6/1 Ib based on a
2388 EACH containers per case. Please 210 Badia Net 30 Badia 00587 6/120z 6 413 $24.78 210 $5,203.80 20008 | ** B[;J:‘l’:ESS SAI::'II:E
indicate if packed differently minimum per S
order not per SAMPLE
Ship Lot: 200 Cases item PASSED




Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Bid II
Refrigerated By the Serving

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Cheese Cubes, Cheddar - pasterized |Land O Lakes 44751000034500
natural mild cheddar cheese cubes
made from cows milk. Serving size to
provide 1 oz. meat/meat alternate for
the Child Nutrition program.

Approximate Pack: 4/5 bags per case. SYSCO
2307 SERVINGS  |please indicate if packed differently. 200,000 MEMPHIS LLc | NET14DAYS LoL 44751 (3297219) 4154 320 0.25 625.00 $78.60 $49,125.00 | NEW ITEM SET UP 4 WEEKS

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Cheese Cubes, Cheddar - pasterized |Land O Lakes 44751000034500
natural mild cheddar cheese cubes
made from cows milk. Serving size to
provide 1 oz. meat/meat alternate for
the Child Nutrition program.

Approximate Pack: 4/5 bags per case.
2307 SERVINGS  |please indicate if packed differently. 200,000 Land O Lakes Net 30 Land O Lakes 44751 4/51b 400 0.14 500.00 $70.74 $35,370.00 3 days AWARD

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Tofu, Pre-Pressed - Refrigerated Soy |Franklin Farms K514
based protein substitute. Product must
be easily recognized as a meat/meat
alternate substitute and must contain at
least 5 grams of protein per 2.2 oz.
serving by weight (1/4 cup volume
equivalent) to credit as 1 oz. meat/meat
alternate. Please provide a Product
2310 SERVINGS ~ |Formulation Sheet to verify crediting. 100,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/O! $0.00 #DIV/O! NO BID
Serving size equals 2.2 oz. Please
indicate if packed differently.

Ship Lot: 150 Cases

Cheese, Cream, Reduced Fat - No Approved Brands
Individual packets of plain reduced-fat
cream cheese. Size/servings equals 1
oz.

2353 SERVINGS 75,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/O! $0.00 #DIV/O! NO BID
Approximate Pack: 100 per case

Ship Lot: 100 Cases
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2024-2025 Miscellaneous Bid II

his-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)

Division of Nutrition Services

Refrigerated By the Serving

2387

SERVINGS

Butter Flavored Whipped Cups, IW -
Whipped butter spread, fluffy, airy,
lightly salted, and ready for spreading
or topping. Individually wrappped 5
gram portion size. Approximate Pack:
720 per case. Please indicate if packed
differently.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brands

300,000

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

#DIV/0!

$0.00

#DIV/0!

NO BID
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2024-2025 Miscellaneous Bid Il
Refrigerated By the Pound

PACK SIZES FOR THE
FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL
PACK SIZES WILL BE
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED
AND EVALUATED.

Butter- Refrigerated, 100% |No Approved Brands
pure butter, solid packed,
must be trans-fat free.
Packed: 30-1 pound

pkgs/case, individually
2328 POUND wrapped. 25,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/0! $0.00 #DIV/0! NO BID

Ship Lot: 250 Cases
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